HOUSE DOCKET, NO. 2770 FILED ON: 1/20/2017

HOUSE ...............No.2358

The Commontwealth of Massachusetts

PRESENTED BY:

Paul Tucker

To the Honorable Senate and House of Representatives of the Commonwealth of Massachusetts in General
Court assembled:

The undersigned legislators and/or citizens respectfully petition for the adoption of the accompanying bill:

An Act adjusting the salaries of justices of the judicial branch.

PETITION OF:
NAME: DISTRICT/ADDRESS:
Paul Tucker 7th Essex

1 of4



10

11

12

HOUSE DOCKET, NO. 2770 FILED ON: 1/20/2017
HOUSE e o e o o o o o o o o o o o o NO. 2358

By Mr. Tucker of Salem, a petition (accompanied by bill, House, No. 2358) of Paul Tucker for
legislation to increase the salaries of justices in the judicial branch . The Judiciary.

The Commontwealth of Massachusetts

In the One Hundred and Ninetieth General Court
(2017-2018)
An Act adjusting the salaries of justices of the judicial branch.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives in General Court assembled, and by the authority
of the same, as follows:

SECTION 1. Section 22 of Chapter 211 of the General laws, as most recently amended
by sections 2 and 4 of chapter 61 of the acts of 2013, is hereby amended by striking the figure

"$181,239" and inserting in place thereof the figure "$196,239"

SECTION 2. Said section 22 is hereby further amended by striking the figure

"$196,239", inserted by section 1, and inserting in place thereof the figure "$210,239"

SECTION 3. Said section 22 is hereby further amended by striking the figure "$175,984"

and inserting in place thereof the figure "$190,984"

SECTION 4. Said section 22 is hereby further amended by striking the figure

"$190,984", inserted by section 3, and inserting in place thereof the figure "$204,984"

SETION 5. Section 2 of chapter 211A of the General Laws, as most recently amended by
sections 6 and 8 of chapter 61 of the acts of 2013, is hereby further amended by striking the

figure "$170,358" and inserting in place thereof the figure of "$185,358"

20of4



13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

29

30

31

32

33

SECTION 6. Said section 2 is hereby further amended by striking the figure "$185,358",

inserted by section 5, and inserting in place thereof the figure "$199,358"

SECTION 7. Said section 2 is hereby further amended by striking the figure "$165,087"

and inserting in place thereof the figure "$180,124"

SECTION 8. Said section 2 is hereby further amended by striking the figure "$180,124",

inserted by section 7, and inserting in place thereof the figure "$194,124"

SECTION 9. Section of Chapter 211B of the General Laws, as most recently amended by
Section 10 of Chapter 61 of the Acts of 2013, is hereby amended by striking the figure

"$159,694" and inserting in place thereof the figure "$174,694"

SECTION 10. Said section 4 is hereby further amended by striking the figure

"$174,694", inserted by section 9, and inserting in place thereof the figure "$188,694"

SECTION 11. Section 4 of Chapter 211B of the General Laws, as most recently amended
by section 12 of Chapter 61 of the acts of 2013, is hereby amended by striking the figure

"$165,124" and inserting in place thereof the figure "$180,124"

SECTION 12. Said Section 4 is further amended by striking the figure "$180,124",

inserted by section 11, and inserting in place thereof the figure "$194,124"

SECTION 13. Section 4 of the Chapter 211B of the General Laws, as most recently
amended by Section 14 of Chapter 61 od the Acts of 2013, is hereby amended by striking the

figure "$170,358" and inserting in place thereof the figure "$185,358"

SECTION 14. Said section 4 is hereby further amended by striking the figure
"$185,358", inserted by section 13, and inserting in place thereof the figure "$199,358"

3of4



34 SECTION 15. Sections, 1, 3,5, 7,9, 11, and 13 of this act shall take effect July 1, 2017.

35 SECTION 16. Section 2, 4, 6, 8, 10, 12, and 14 of this act shall take effect July 1, 2018.

4 of 4



