
State of South Dakota
EIGHTY-EIGHTH SESSION

LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY, 2013

194U0712
SENATE BILL  NO.  234

Introduced by: Senators Rave, Krebs, Lederman, Olson (Russell), Soholt, and Tidemann and
Representatives Cronin, Dryden, Hunhoff (Bernie), Lust, Munsterman, and
Novstrup (David)

FOR AN ACT ENTITLED, An Act to revise the General Appropriations Act for fiscal year1

2013 to provide funding for the increased costs associated with the Board of Regents2

employee health insurance and to declare an emergency.3

BE IT ENACTED BY THE LEGISLATURE OF THE STATE OF SOUTH DAKOTA:4

Section 1. That section 14 of chapter 30 of the 2012 Session Laws be amended to read as5

follows:6

BOARD OF REGENTS7

(1) Regents Central Office8

Personal Services, General Funds, delete "$3,624,219" and insert "$3,691,383"9

Personal Services, Other Funds, delete "$1,865,139" and insert "$1,901,459"10

Adjust all totals accordingly.11

Section 2. That section 14 of chapter 30 of the 2012 Session Laws be amended to read as12

follows:13

BOARD OF REGENTS14

170 copies were printed on recycled paper by the South Dakota
Legislative Research Council at a cost of $.093 per page. v

 Insertions into existing statutes are indicated by underscores.
Deletions from existing statutes are indicated by overstrikes.



- 2 - SB 234

(4) University of South Dakota Proper1

Personal Services, General Funds, delete "$27,446,842" and insert "$28,897,673"2

Personal Services, Federal Funds, delete "$8,732,373" and insert "$8,871,162"3

Personal Services, Other Funds, delete "$38,474,379" and insert "$39,501,838"4

Adjust all totals accordingly.5

Section 3. That section 14 of chapter 30 of the 2012 Session Laws be amended to read as6

follows:7

BOARD OF REGENTS8

(5) University of South Dakota School of Medicine9

Personal Services, General Funds, delete "$16,270,308" and insert "$16,540,570"10

Personal Services, Federal Funds, delete "$8,499,070" and insert "$8,582,699"11

Personal Services, Other Funds, delete "$9,949,992" and insert "$10,142,717"12

Adjust all totals accordingly.13

Section 4. That section 14 of chapter 30 of the 2012 Session Laws be amended to read as14

follows:15

BOARD OF REGENTS16

(6) South Dakota State University Proper17

Personal Services, General Funds, delete "$34,759,862" and insert "$36,803,610"18

Personal Services, Federal Funds, delete "$15,720,299" and insert "$15,902,820"19

Personal Services, Other Funds, delete "$72,415,889" and insert "$72,648,470"20

Adjust all totals accordingly.21

Section 5. That section 14 of chapter 30 of the 2012 Session Laws be amended to read as22

follows:23

BOARD OF REGENTS24



- 3 - SB 234

(7) Cooperative Extension Service1

Personal Services, General Funds, delete "$7,289,150" and insert "$7,409,947"2

Personal Services, Federal Funds, delete "$5,235,302" and insert "$5,291,664"3

Personal Services, Other Funds, delete "$799,944" and insert "$812,971"4

Adjust all totals accordingly.5

Section 6. That section 14 of chapter 30 of the 2012 Session Laws be amended to read as6

follows:7

BOARD OF REGENTS8

(8) Agricultural Experiment Station9

Personal Services, General Funds, delete "$9,566,991" and insert "$9,695,998"10

Personal Services, Federal Funds, delete "$8,053,808" and insert "$8,106,958"11

Personal Services, Other Funds, delete "$5,099,905" and insert "$5,180,961"12

Adjust all totals accordingly.13

Section 7. That section 14 of chapter 30 of the 2012 Session Laws be amended to read as14

follows:15

BOARD OF REGENTS16

(9) South Dakota School of Mines and Technology17

Personal Services, General Funds, delete "$12,856,404" and insert "$13,324.773"18

Personal Services, Federal Funds, delete "$20,508,231" and insert "$20,531,686"19

Personal Services, Other Funds, delete "$16,057,032" and insert "$16,110,908"20

Adjust all totals accordingly.21

Section 8. That section 14 of chapter 30 of the 2012 Session Laws be amended to read as22

follows:23

BOARD OF REGENTS24



- 4 - SB 234

(10) Northern State University1

Personal Services, General Funds, delete "$10,464,840" and insert "$10,948,562"2

Personal Services, Federal Funds, delete "$1,243,739" and insert "$1,261,155"3

Personal Services, Other Funds, delete "$11,956,352" and insert "$11,999,468"4

Adjust all totals accordingly.5

Section 9. That section 14 of chapter 30 of the 2012 Session Laws be amended to read as6

follows:7

BOARD OF REGENTS8

(11) Black Hills State University9

Personal Services, General Funds, delete "$6,656,695" and insert "$7,188,892"10

Personal Services, Federal Funds, delete "$3,901,197" and insert "$3,931,507"11

Personal Services, Other Funds, delete "$19,670,093" and insert "$19,739,051"12

Adjust all totals accordingly.13

Section 10. That section 14 of chapter 30 of the 2012 Session Laws be amended to read as14

follows:15

BOARD OF REGENTS16

(12) Dakota State University17

Personal Services, General Funds, delete "$7,602,586" and insert "$7,999,861"18

Personal Services, Federal Funds, delete "$2,446,990" and insert "$2,467,809"19

Personal Services, Other Funds, delete "$10,705,373" and insert "$10,730,597"20

Adjust all totals accordingly.21

Section 11. That section 14 of chapter 30 of the 2012 Session Laws be amended to read as22

follows:23

BOARD OF REGENTS24



- 5 - SB 234

(13) South Dakota School for the Deaf1

Personal Services, General Funds, delete "$1,399,214" and insert "$1,434,744"2

Adjust all totals accordingly.3

Section 12. That section 14 of chapter 30 of the 2012 Session Laws be amended to read as4

follows:5

BOARD OF REGENTS6

(14) South Dakota School for the Blind and Visually Impaired7

Personal Services, General Funds, delete "$2,362,926" and insert "$2,442,654"8

Personal Services, Federal Funds, delete "$276,069" and insert "$276,687"9

Adjust all totals accordingly.10

Section 13. Whereas, this Act is necessary for the support of the state government and its11

existing public institutions, an emergency is hereby declared to exist, and this Act shall be in12

full force and effect from and after its passage and approval.13


