AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

1181TH CONGRESS
L8 H, R. 3963

To amend the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to improve the low-income
housing credit.

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

JUNE 9, 2023
Mr. Evaxs (for himself and Mr. FITZPATRICK) introduced the following bill;
which was referred to the Committee on Ways and Means

A BILL

To amend the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to improve

the low-income housing credit.

[E—

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Visitable Inclusive Tax
Credits for Accessible Living (VITAL) Act”.

SEC. 2. PURPOSE.
The purposes of this Act are to—

(1) increase low-income housing tax credits to

NelNe o e Y, e~ L OV R \O)

increase the stock of disability-accessible and afford-

[am—
)

able housing;



O o0 N N W BB W

|\ T NO TR NG T NS R NS R L e e T e D e e T S
A W N = O VWV 0 N O W BN~ WD = ©

SEC.

2

(2) ensure that States are using the Federal
tax credits to construct housing that will meet the
needs of an aging population and currently under-
served populations such as households with people
with disabilities;

(3) encourage States to make sure older adults
and underserved populations are integrated into
their community and can fully participate in society;
and

(4) increase technical assistance, awareness,
knowledge, and understanding of the low-income
housing credit program and the housing needs of
older adults and people with disabilities.

3. FINDINGS.
Congress makes the following findings:

(1) By 2030, 1T in every 5 Americans will be
over age 65, and currently, 2 in 5 adults over age
65 have a disability. As people age, they need struc-
turally safe and functional housing that accommo-
dates people with disabilities.

(2) Approximately 26 percent of people in the
United States have a disability, yet less than 6 per-
cent of the national housing supply is designed to be

even rudimentarily accessible.

*HR 3963 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

|\ I NO TR NG T NS R NS R L e e T e D e e T S
A W N = O VWV o0 NN O B BN~ WD = O

3

(3) An accessible home offers specific features
or technologies such as lowered kitchen counters and
sinks, widened doorways, and zero-step showers.

(4) A lack of affordable and accessible housing
can relegate people with disabilities to living in insti-
tutional settings when they would prefer to live in a
community setting.

(5) Older adults and people with disabilities
prefer to remain in their homes for as long as pos-
sible. More than 89 percent of adults age 65 and
over hope to stay in their homes as they age.

(6) Older adults and people with disabilities
must be able to run errands, work, visit family and
friends, and keep doctor appointments, while not al-
ways being able to drive. Accessible and affordable
public transit options and walkable and roll-able
neighborhoods allow older adults to remain inde-
pendent and active in their communities.

(7) Many older adults and people with disabil-
ities are experiencing an affordability crisis. Ap-
proximately 4,800,000 non-institutionalized people
with disabilities who depend on Federal monthly
Supplemental Security Income have incomes aver-

aging only about $9,156 per year, low enough to be

*HR 3963 IH



O o0 9 AN U B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

4

priced out of every rental housing market in the na-

tion.

SEC. 4. INCREASES IN STATE ALLOCATIONS.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Clause (11) of section 42(h)(3)(C)

of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 1s amended—

(1) by striking “$1.75” in subclause (I) and in-
serting “$4.47”, and

(2) by striking “$2,000,000” in subclause (II)
and inserting “$5,154,965”.

(b) CoOST-OF-LIVING ADJUSTMENT.—Subparagraph

(H) of section 42(h)(3) of the Internal Revenue Code of
1986 18 amended—

(1) by striking “2002” in clause (i) and insert-
ing 2023”7,
(2) by striking ‘“the $2,000,000 and $1.75

7 in clause (1) and in-

amounts in subparagraph (C)
serting “‘the $5,154,965 and $4.47 amounts in sub-
paragraph (C)”,

(3) by striking “2001” in clause (1)(II) and in-
serting 2022,

(4) by striking “$2,000,000 amount” in clause
(i1)(I) and inserting “$5,154,965”, and

(5) by striking “$1.75 amount” in clause

(i1)(IT) and inserting “$4.47".

*HR 3963 IH



O o0 N N W B W =

[\© TN NG T N T NG I NS R NS R N e T e e T e T e T T
[ B NG U N N = = N R - BN B o) W ) B ~S O T NO R e

-

J

(¢) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
this section shall apply to calendar years beginning after
December 31, 2023.

SEC. 5. TAX-EXEMPT BOND FINANCING REQUIREMENT.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Subparagraph (B) of section
42(h)(4) of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 1s amended
by adding at the end the following: “In the case of build-
ings financed by an obligation first taken into account
under section 146 in calendar years beginning after 2023,
the preceding sentence shall be applied by substituting ‘25
percent’ for ‘50 percent’.”.

(b) EFrFECTIVE DATE.—The amendment made by
this section shall apply to buildings placed in service in
taxable years beginning after December 31, 2023.

SEC. 6. INCREASE IN CREDIT FOR PROJECTS DESIGNATED
TO SERVE HOUSEHOLDS WITH PEOPLE WITH
DISABILITIES.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Paragraph (5) of section 42(d) of
the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is amended by adding
at the end the following new subparagraph:

“(C) INCREASE IN CREDIT FOR PROJECTS
DESIGNATED TO SERVE HOUSEIIOLDS WITII

PEOPLE WITH DISABILITIES.

“(1) IN GENERAL.—In the case of any

building—

*HR 3963 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

*HR 3963 IH

6

“(I) 50 percent or more of the
low-income units in the building are
units designated by the taxpayer to
meet the applicable design standards
for occupancy by persons with mental,
physical, sensory, or developmental
disabilities,

“(II) which 1s located in a census
block group designated by the Envi-
ronmental  Protection Agency as
being—

“(aa) above average or bet-
ter in terms of walkability, or

“(bb) adjacent to 2 or more
census tracts described in item

(aa), and

“(ITT) which is designated by the
housing credit agency as requiring the
increase in credit under this subpara-
oeraph in order for such building to be
financially feasible as part of a quali-

fied low-income housing project,

subparagraph (B) shall not apply to the
portion of such building which is comprised

of such units, and the eligible basis of such



O o0 N N W Bk W =

[\ I \© R \O I O R N e e e e e e D e e
W = O O 0N N R, WD = O

7
portion of the building shall be 130 per-

cent of such basis determined without re-
card to this subparagraph.

“(11) DESIGN STANDARDS.—For pur-
poses of clause (1)(I), the term ‘applicable
design standards’ means the principles and
standards of adaptable design as detailed
in  the Uniform Federal Accessibility
Standards, or any successor standard des-
ignated by the Secretary.”.

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendment made by
this section shall apply to buildings which receive alloca-
tions of housing credit dollar amount or, in the case of
projects financed by tax-exempt obligations as described
in section 42(h)(4) of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986,
which are first taken into account under section 146 of
such Code, after the date of the enactment of this Act.
SEC. 7. REQUIREMENT FOR PROJECTS DESIGNATED TO

SERVE HOUSEHOLDS WITH PEOPLE WITH
DISABILITIES.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Paragraph (1) of section 42(m)

of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is amended by add-

ing at the end the following new subparagraph:

*HR 3963 IH



O o0 N N W B W

O TN NG I N T NG I NG R NS B N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B N O N N = = N Re - BN B o) W ) B ~S O B NO R e

8
“(E) PROJECTS DESIGNATED TO SERVE
HOUSEHOLDS WITH PEOPLE WITH DISABIL-
ITIES.—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—The qualified allo-
cation plan shall ensure that, with respect
to any 3-year period, the applicable per-
centage is not less than 40 percent.

“(11) APPLICABLE PERCENTAGE.—For
purposes of this subparagraph, the applica-
ble percentage is the ratio (expressed as a
percentage) of—

“(I) the number of low-income
units in all projects receiving an allo-
cation of the housing ecredit dollar
amount during such period which
meet the requirements of subclause
(I) of subsection (d)(5)(C)(1), to

“(IT) the ageregate number of all
low-income units in all projects receiv-
ing an allocation of the housing credit
dollar amount during such period.
“(i11) SPECIAL RULE.—For purposes

of clause (i1)(I), any low-income unit which
18 part of a project which meets the re-

quirements of both subclause (I) and sub-

*HR 3963 IH



O o0 N N W B W =

[\O I \© R \O I O N N e e e e e e D e e
W = O O 0N N RN = O

24
25

9
clause (II) of subsection (d)(5)(C)(1) shall
be counted twice.”.

(b) EFrFECTIVE DATE.—The amendment made by
this section shall apply to buildings which receive alloca-
tions of housing credit dollar amount or, in the case of
projects financed by tax-exempt obligations as described
in section 42(h)(4) of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986,
which are first taken into account under section 146 of
such Code, after the date of the enactment of this Act.
SEC. 8. RESOURCE CENTERS FOR THE LOW-INCOME HOUS-

ING TAX CREDIT PROGRAM.

(a) DEFINITIONS.—In this section:

(1) CENTER.—The term “Center’” means a Re-
source Center established under subsection (b).

(2) PROGRAM.—The term ‘“Program’” means a
program established for allocating amount under
section 42(h) of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986.
(b) ESTABLISHMENT.—Each State housing finance

agency shall establish and operate a Resource Center for

the Low-Income Housing Tax Credit Program to support

new applicants and recipients for the Program in the State

by
(1) providing potential applicants and recipients
with information and technical assistance to effec-

tively prepare and submit a Program application;

*HR 3963 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG I N T NG I NG R N R N e T e e T e T e T T
[ N N O N N s = NN - BN B o) W ) B ~S O I NO I e

10

(2) ensuring that all interested and eligible en-
tities have the tools to apply for the Program;

(3) prioritizing providing assistance to nonprofit
and first-time developers applying for the Program;

(4) identifying potential barriers to preparing
and submitting a successful application for the Pro-
oram; and

(5) proposing streamlined solutions to those
barriers that the State and each locality within the

State can adopt.

(¢) OPERATING STANDARDS AND REPORTING RE-
QUIREMENTS.—Each State housing finance agency shall
develop and issue operating standards and reporting re-
quirements for the Center established by the agency.

(d) SET ASIDE.—There is authorized to be appro-
priated $8,250,000 for fiscal year 2024 and each fiscal
yvear thereafter to carry out this section, of which
$150,000 shall be allocated each fiscal year to each State
housing finance agency located in—

(1) a State of the United States;
(2) the District of Columbia; or
(3) a territory of the United States.
SEC. 9. NATIONAL LOW-INCOME HOUSING TAX CREDIT AD-
VISORY COUNCIL.

(a) DEFINITIONS.—In this section:

*HR 3963 IH



11

(1) CouNciL.—The term “Council” means the
National Low-Income Housing Tax Credit Advisory
Couneil established under subsection (b).

(2) COVERED PROPERTY.—The term ‘“‘covered
property’” means a building receiving an allocation of
credit under section 42 of the Internal Revenue
Code of 1986.

(b) ESTABLISHMENT.—There is established a Na-

tional Liow-Income Housing Tax Credit Advisory Council.

(¢) MEMBERSHIP.—

(1) SELECTION; CHAIR.—The Council shall be
comprised of members selected by a designee jointly
selected by the Secretary of Housing and Urban De-
velopment and the Secretary of the Treasury, who
shall serve as chair of the Council.

(2) MEMBERS.—The Council shall be composed

of not less than 1 representative from each of the
following groups:

(A) Community-based organizations that
support individuals with disabilities living in
covered properties.

(B) Community-based organizations that
support older adults living in covered prop-

erties.

*HR 3963 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

O TN NG T N T NG I NG B NS B S e e T e e T e T e e T
[ T NG U N N = = N Re - BN B e ) W ) B “S O I NO R e

12

(C) Community-based organizations that
support veterans living in covered properties.

(D) Community-based organizations that
support families and children living in covered
properties.

(E) A multi-State not-for-profit housing
developer.

(') A multi-State for-profit housing devel-
oper.

(G) Investors or syndicators of funds to
which credits allocated under section 42 of the
Internal Revenue Code of 1986 are sold.

(H) The research community.

(I) State housing finance agencies.

(3) QUALIFICATIONS.—The members of the

Couneil shall—

(A) have a lived experience as part of the
eroup they represent; and

(B) represent a diversity of—

(1) educational and professional back-
erounds;

(i) racial, ethnic, gender, and lin-
euistic identities;

(iii) disabilities, including intellectual

disabilities;

*HR 3963 IH



O o0 N N BB W =

O TN NG T N T NG I NG I NG B S e e T e e T e T e e
[ T NG U N N = = N RN - BN B o) W ) LR ~S O B NO S e

13
(iv) ages; and
(v) geographic locations.
(4) DURATION.—Each member of the Council
shall be appointed for a period of 3 years and may
be re-appointed for an additional term.

(d) Duries.—The Counecil shall provide best practice

recommendations and resources to State housing finance

agencies, developers, investors, and consumers related to

national trends in the development of affordable housing

under section 42 of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986.
(e) REPORT.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—The Counecil shall submit to
each State housing finance agency and the Secretary
of Housing and Urban Development a report, which
shall be submitted not less frequently than once
every 3 years, with final recommendations on best
practices to—

(A) fulfill the mission of the credits allo-
cated under section 42 of the Internal Revenue

Code of 1986;

(B) serve the needs of individuals with dis-
abilities and older adults; and

(C) study the effects of factors such as
zoning, land use requirements, location, and

cost of affordable housing developments.

*HR 3963 IH



O© 00 3 O WD B W N e

[a—
S

14
(2) PUBLIC AVAILABILITY.—Upon receiving a
report submitted under paragraph (1), the Secretary
of Housing and Urban Development shall make the

report available to the public.

(f) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.—There is
authorized to be appropriated $15,000,000 for fiscal year
2024 and each fiscal year thereafter to carry out this sec-
tion, which amounts shall be provided to the Council to

cover the costs of travel and the necessary operations of

the Couneil.

*HR 3963 IH




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-07-10T08:18:47-0400
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




