AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

11

1141H CONGRESS
18T SESSION S. 34 1

To amend the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to make permanent certain
small business tax provisions, and for other purposes.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

FEBRUARY 3, 2015
Mr. TooMmEY (for himself, Mr. MENENDEZ, Mr. ROBERTS, and Mr. CARPER)
introduced the following bill; which was read twice and referred to the
Committee on Finance

A BILL

To amend the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to make
permanent certain small business tax provisions, and for

other purposes.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Start-up Jobs and In-

2

3

4

5 mnovation Act”.
6 SEC. 2. PERMANENT EXTENSION OF INCREASED EXPENS-
7 ING LIMITATION.

8 (a) DOLLAR LIMITATION.—Section 179(b)(1) of the
9

Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is amended by striking



2

I “shall not exceed” and all that follows and inserting “‘shall
2 not exceed $500,000.”.
3 (b) REDUCTION IN LIMITATION.—Section 179(b)(2)

4 of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is amended—

5 (1) by striking subparagraph (C),

6 (2) by striking “, and” at the end of subpara-
7 oraph (B) and inserting a period,

8 (3) by striking the comma at the end of sub-
9 paragraph (A) and inserting , and”, and

10 (4) by inserting ‘“‘beginning before 2016”7 after
11 “The limitation under paragraph (1) for any taxable
12 year’’.

13 (¢) ADJUSTMENT FOR INFLATION.—Subsection (b)

14 of section 179 of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 1s

15 amended by adding at the end the following new para-

16 graph:

17 “(6) ADJUSTMENT FOR INFLATION.—In the
18 case of any taxable year beginning after December
19 31, 2016, the $500,000 amount in paragraph (1)
20 shall be increased by an amount equal to—

21 “(A) such dollar amount, multiplied by

22 “(B) the cost-of-living adjustment deter-
23 mined under section 1(f)(3) for the calendar
24 yvear in which the taxable year begins, by sub-

oS 341 IS



O o0 N N D Bk W =

[\ I NS R T e e T e T e D e e T
—_— O O o0 N N M R~ W NN = O

22
23
24

3
stituting ‘calendar year 2014’ for ‘calendar year
1992 in subparagraph (B) thereof.

If any amount as increased under the preceding sen-

tence is not a multiple of $1,000, such amount shall

be rounded to the nearest multiple of $1,000.”.

(d) COMPUTER SOFTWARE.—Section
179(d)(1)(A)(i1) of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is
amended by striking “‘and before 2015”.

(e) ELECTION.—Section 179(¢)(2) of the Internal

“and before

Revenue Code of 1986 is amended by striking
20157,

(f) SPECIAL RULES FOR TREATMENT OF QUALIFIED
REAL PROPERTY.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—Section 179(f)(1) of the In-
ternal Revenue Code of 1986 is amended by striking
“beginning after 2009 and before 2015”7 and insert-
ing “beginning after 2009,

(2) REPEAL OF LIMITATION.—Section 179(f) of
such Code is amended by striking paragraph (3).

(3) CONFORMING AMENDMENT.—Section 179(f)
of such Code is amended by striking paragraph (4).
(2) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by

this section shall apply to property placed in service in

taxable years beginning after December 31, 2014.

oS 341 IS



4
1 SEC. 3. PERMANENT FULL EXCLUSION APPLICABLE TO

2 QUALIFIED SMALL BUSINESS STOCK.

3 (a) IN GENERAL.—Paragraph (4) of section 1202(a)
4 of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is amended—

5 (1) by striking “and before January 1, 20157,
6 and

7 (2) by striking “CERTAIN PERIODS IN 2010,
8 2011, 2012, 2013, AND 2014”" in the heading and in-
9 serting “CERTAIN PERIODS AFTER 2009,

10 (b) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.

11 (1) The heading for section 1202 of the Inter-
12 nal Revenue Code of 1986 is amended by striking
13 “PARTIAL".

14 (2) The item relating to section 1202 in the
15 table of sections for part I of subchapter P of chap-
16 ter 1 of such Code is amended by striking ‘“‘Partial
17 exclusion” and inserting “Exclusion”.

18 (3) Section 1223(13) of such Code is amended
19 by striking “1202(a)(2),”.
20 (¢) INCREASE IN GROSS ASSET THRESHOLD.—
21 (1) IN GENERAL.—Paragraph (1) of section
22 1202(d) of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is
23 amended by striking “$50,000,000” each place it
24 appears and inserting “$150,000,000.

oS 341 IS



O o0 N N D B W =

[\© TN NG T N T NG I NG R NS R N e T e e T e T e e
[ T NG U N N = = NN - BN B e ) W ) TR ~S O I NO S e

5}
(2) ADJUSTMENT FOR INFLATION.—Subsection

(d) of section 1202 of such Code is amended by add-

ing at the end the following new paragraph:

“(4) ADJUSTMENT FOR INFLATION.—In the
case of any taxable year beginning after December

31, 2016, the $150,000,000 amount in subpara-

oraphs (A) and (B) of paragraph (1) shall be in-

creased by an amount equal to—
“(A) such dollar amount, multiplied by
“(B) the cost-of-living adjustment deter-
mined under section 1(f)(3) for the calendar
yvear in which the taxable year begins, by sub-
stituting ‘calendar year 2015’ for ‘calendar year
1992’ in subparagraph (B) thereof.

If any amount as increased under the preceding sen-

tence is not a multiple of $1,000, such amount shall

be rounded to the nearest multiple of $1,000.”.

(d) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
this section shall apply to stock acquired after December
31, 2015.

SEC. 4. UNIFICATION OF DEDUCTION FOR START-UP AND
ORGANIZATIONAL EXPENDITURES.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Subsection (a) of section 195 of

the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is amended by insert-

[

ing “‘and organizational” after “start-up”.

oS 341 IS



6

1 (b) ORGANIZATIONAL EXPENDITURES.—Subsection
2 (e) of section 195 of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986
3 is amended by adding at the end the following new para-
4 oraph:

5 “(3) ORGANIZATIONAL EXPENDITURES.—The
6 term ‘organizational expenditures’ means any ex-
7 penditure which

8 “(A) 18 mcident to the creation of a cor-
9 poration or a partnership,

10 “(B) is chargeable to capital account, and
11 “(C) is of a character which, if expended
12 incident to the creation of a corporation or a
13 partnership having a limited life, would be am-
14 ortizable over such life.”.

15 (¢) DorpAR AMOUNTS.—Clause (i1) of section

16 195(b)(1)(A) of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is

17 amended—

18 (1) by striking “$5,000” and inserting
19 “$10,000”, and

20 (2) by striking “$50,000” and inserting
21 “$60,000".

22 (d) ADJUSTMENT FOR INFLATION.—Paragraph (3)

23 of section 195(b) 1s amended to read as follows:

24 “(3) ADJUSTMENT FOR INFLATION.—In the
25 case of any taxable year beginning after December

oS 341 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

O TN NG T N T NG I NG I NG B S e e T e e T e T e e T
L R W NN = DO 0O XN R WD~ O

31,

7
2016, the $10,000 and $60,000 amounts in

paragraph (1)(A)(ii) shall each be increased by an

amount equal to—

“(A) such dollar amount, multiplied by

“(B) the cost-of-living adjustment deter-
mined under section 1(f)(3) for the calendar
year in which the taxable year begins, by sub-
stituting ‘calendar year 2015 for ‘calendar year

1992’ in subparagraph (B) thereof.

If any amount as increased under the preceding sen-

tence is not a multiple of $1,000, such amount shall

be rounded to the nearest multiple of $1,000.”.

(¢) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—

(1) Section 195(b)(1) of the Internal Revenue

Code of 1986 is amended—

ed—

oS 341 IS

(A) by inserting ““(or, in the case of a part-
nership, the partnership elects)” after “If a tax-
payer elects”,

(B) by inserting “(or the partnership, as

)

the case may be)” after “‘the taxpayer’ in sub-
paragraph (A), and
(C) by inserting ‘“‘or organizational” after

“start-up”” each place it appears.

(2) Section 195(b)(2) of such Code is amend-



O© o0 3 O WD A W N e

|\ T NO T NG T NS R NS R S T e e T e T e T e e e T
A W N = O VWV 00O NN O W BN~ WD == ©

8

(A) by striking “AMORTIZATION PERIOD.—
In any case” and inserting “AMORTIZATION PE-
RIOD.—

“(A) IN GENERAL.—In any case”, and

(B) by adding at the end the following new
subparagraph:

“(B) SPECIAL PARTNERSHIP RULE.—In

the case of a partnership, subparagraph (A)

shall be applied at the partnership level.”.

(3)(A) Part VIII of subchapter B of chapter 1
of such Code is amended by striking section 248.

(B) Section 170(b)(2)(C)(11) of such Code 1is
amended by striking “‘(except section 248)”.

(C) Section 312(n)(3) of such Code is amended
by striking “Sections 173 and 248”7 and inserting
“Section 173",

(D) Section 535(b)(3) of such Code is amended
by striking “‘(except section 248)”.

(E) Section 545(b)(3) of such Code is amended
by striking ““(except section 248)”.

(F) Section 834(¢)(7) of such Code is amended
by striking ““(except section 248)”.

(G) Section 852(b)(2)(C) of such Code 1s

amended by striking *‘(except section 248)".

oS 341 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\O I \© R \O I O R N e e e e e e D e e
W N = O O 0N N RN = O

9
(H) Section 857(b)(2)(A) of such Code 1s

amended by striking *‘(except section 248)".

(I) Section 1363(b) of such Code is amended by
inserting “and” at the end of paragraph (2), by
striking paragraph (3), and by redesignating para-
oraph (4) as paragraph (3).

(J) Section 1375(b)(1)(B)(1) of such Code 1s
amended by striking “(other than the deduction al-
lowed by section 248, relating to organization ex-
penditures)”.

(K) The table of sections for part VIII of sub-
chapter B of chapter 1 of such Code is amended by
striking the item relating to section 248.

(4) Part I of subchapter K of chapter 1 of such
Code is amended by striking section 709.

(5) The table of sections for part I of sub-
chapter K of chapter 1 of such Code is amended by
striking the item relating to section 709.

(f) CLERICAL AMENDMENTS.—

(1) The heading of section 195 of the Internal
Revenue Code of 1986 is amended by striking “EX-
PENDITURES” and inserting ‘“AND ORGANIZA-

TIONAL EXPENDITURES”.

oS 341 IS



(O8]

O o0 9 N W B

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

10

(2) The item relating to section 195 in the table

of contents of part VI of subchapter B of chapter 1

of such Code 1s amended to read as follows:

“See. 195. Start-up and organizational expenditures.”.

(¢) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by

this section shall apply to expenses paid or incurred after

December 31, 2015.

SEC. 5. EXPANSION OF GROSS RECEIPTS TEST.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Paragraph (1) of section 448(c)

of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 1s amended—

(1) by striking “the $5,000,000 eross receipts

test” and inserting “the gross receipts test”, and

(2) by striking “does not exceed $5,000,000

and inserting “does not exceed $10,000,000.

(b) ADJUSTMENT FOR INFLATION.—Subsection (¢)

of section 448 of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is

amended

oraph:

case

by adding at the end the following new para-

“(4) ADJUSTMENT FOR INFLATION.—In the

of any taxable year beginning after December

31, 2016, the $10,000,000 amount in paragraph (1)

shall be increased by an amount equal to—

oS 341 IS

“(A) such dollar amount, multiplied by
“(B) the cost-of-living adjustment deter-
mined under section 1(f)(3) for the calendar

yvear in which the taxable year begins, by sub-



O o0 N N W B W =

O TN NG T N T NG N NG R NS B e T e e T e T e e T
[ T N U N N e = N R - BN B o) W ) B ~SU O I NO I e

11

stituting ‘calendar year 2015 for ‘calendar year

1992 in subparagraph (B) thereof.

If any amount as increased under the preceding sen-
tence is not a multiple of $1,000, such amount shall
be rounded to the nearest multiple of $1,000.”.

(¢) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—

(1) Paragraph (3) of section 448(b) of the In-
ternal Revenue Code of 1986 is amended by striking
“the $5,000,000 gross receipts test” and inserting
“the gross receipts test”.

(2) The heading for paragraph (3) of section
448(b) of such Code is amended by striking “wirTH
GROSS RECEIPTS OF NOT MORE THAN $5,000,000”
and inserting “THAT PASS GROSS RECEIPTS TEST”.

(3) The heading for subsection (¢) of section
448 of such Code is amended by striking
“$5,000,000 GROSS” and inserting “GROSS”.

(4) Clause (i11) of section 172(b)(1)(F) of such

44

Code is amended by inserting *, applied by sub-
stituting ‘$5,000,000” for ‘$10,000,000’ each place
it appears,” after ‘“‘section 448(c)”.

(5) Subclause (IT) of section 172(b)(1)(H)(v) of
such Code is amended by striking “$5,000,000” and
inserting “$10,000,000".

(d) EFFECTIVE DATE AND SPECIAL RULES.—

oS 341 IS



O o0 N N D B W =

|\ I N© TR NG T NS R NS R L e T e T e T e e T T
A W N = O VWV 00 N O B BN~ WD = ©

12

(1) IN GENERAL.—The amendments made by
this section shall apply to taxable years beginning
after December 31, 2015.

(2) CHANGE IN METHOD OF ACCOUNTING.—In
the case of any taxpayer changing the taxpayer’s
method of accounting for any taxable year under the
amendments made by this section—

(A) such change shall be treated as initi-
ated by the taxpayer; and
(B) such change shall be treated as made
with the consent of the Secretary of the Treas-
ury.
SEC. 6. CLARIFICATION OF INVENTORY AND ACCOUNTING
RULES FOR SMALL BUSINESS.

(a) CASIHH ACCOUNTING PERMITTED.—Section 446 of
the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is amended by adding
at the end the following new subsection:

“(2) CERTAIN SMALL BUSINESS TAXPAYERS PER-
MITTED TO USE CAsH ACCOUNTING METHOD WITHOUT
LIMITATION.—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—With respect to an eligible
taxpayer who uses the cash receipts and disburse-
ments method for any taxable year, such method

shall be deemed to clearly reflect income and the

oS 341 IS



O o0 N N n BB W =

e T e e e S
AN LN A~ WD = O

17

18 To USE INVENTORIES.

19
20
21
22
23
24
25

13

taxpayer shall not be required to use an accrual
method.

“(2) ELIGIBLE TAXPAYER.—For purposes of
this subsection, a taxpayer is an eligible taxpayer
with respect to any taxable year if—

“(A) for all prior taxable years beginning
after December 31, 2015, the taxpayer (or any
predecessor) met the gross receipts test of see-
tion 448(c), and

“(B) the taxpayer is not subject to section

447 or 448.7.

(b) INVENTORY RULES.

(1) IN GENERAL.—Section 471 of the Internal

Revenue Code of 1986 is amended by redesignating
subsection (¢) as subsection (d) and by inserting
after subsection (b) the following new subsection:

“(¢) SMALL BUSINESS TAXPAYERS NOT REQUIRED

“(1) IN GENERAL.—A qualified taxpayer shall
not be required to use inventories under this section
for a taxable year.

“(2) TREATMENT OF TAXPAYERS NOT USING

INVENTORIES.

If a qualified taxpayer does not use
mventories with respect to any property for any tax-

able year beginning after December 31, 2015, such

oS 341 IS



O o0 N N B W =

[\ N \© R \O I O R N i e e e e e T e e
W N = O O 0N N R, WD = O

14
property shall be treated as a material or supply
which is not incidental.

“(3) QUALIFIED TAXPAYER.—For purposes of
this subsection, the term ‘qualified taxpayer’
means—

“(A) any ecligible taxpayer (as defined in
section 446(2)(2)), and
“(B) any taxpayer described in section

448(b)(3).”.

(2) INCREASED ELIGIBILITY FOR SIMPLIFIED
DOLLAR-VALUE LIFO METHOD.—Section 474(¢) of
such Code is amended by striking “$5,000,000” and
inserting “$10,000,000".

(3) CONFORMING AMENDMENT.—Subsection (¢)
of section 263A of such Code is amended by adding

at the end the following new paragraph:

“(7) EXCLUSION FROM INVENTORY RULES.
Nothing in this section shall require the use of in-
ventories for any taxable year by a qualified tax-
payer (within the meaning of section 471(¢)) who is
not required to use inventories under section 471 for

such taxable year.”.

(¢) EFFECTIVE DATE AND SPECIAL RULES.

oS 341 IS



15

| (1) IN GENERAL.—The amendments made by
2 this section shall apply to taxable years beginning
3 after December 31, 2015.

4 (2) CHANGE IN METHOD OF ACCOUNTING.—In
5 the case of any taxpayer changing the taxpayer’s
6 method of accounting for any taxable year under the
7 amendments made by this section—

8 (A) such change shall be treated as initi-
9 ated by the taxpayer; and

10 (B) such change shall be treated as made
11 with the consent of the Secretary of the Treas-
12 ury.

13 SEC. 7. EXCEPTION FROM PASSIVE LOSS RULES FOR IN-
14 VESTMENTS IN HIGH TECHNOLOGY RE-
15 SEARCH SMALL BUSINESS PASS-THRU ENTI-
16 TIES.

17 (a) IN GENERAL.—Subsection (¢) of section 469 is
18 amended by redesignating paragraphs (4) through (7) as

19 paragraphs (5) through (8), respectively, and by inserting

20 after paragraph (3) the following new paragraph:

21 “(4) HiGH TECHNOLOGY RESEARCH ACTIVI-
22 TIES.

23 “(A) IN GENERAL.—The term ‘passive ac-
24 tivity’ shall not include any qualified research
25 activity of the taxpayer carried on by a high

oS 341 IS



O© o0 23 O WD A W N =

|\ I NO TR NG T NS R NS R e e T e T e e e T
A W N = O VWV o0 N O W B~ WD == ©

oS 341 IS

16

technology research small business pass-thru

entity.

“(B) TREATMENT OF LOSSES AND DEDUC-

TIONS.—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—Liosses or deduc-
tions of a taxpayer in connection with
qualified research activities carried on by a
high technology research small business
pass-thru entity shall not be treated as
losses or deductions, respectively, from a
passive activity except as provided in
clause (i1) and subparagraph (C).

“(11) LiMiTATION.—Clause (1) shall
apply to losses and deductions of a tax-
payer in connection with a high technology
small business pass-thru entity for a tax-
able year only to the extent that the aggre-
cate losses and deductions of the taxpayer
in connection with qualified research activi-
ties of such entity for such taxable year do
not exceed the portion of the taxpayer’s
adjusted basis in the taxpayer’s ownership
interest in such entity that is attributable

to money or other property contributed—



O o0 N N W BB W

|\ I O TR NG I NS I NS R L e e T e T e e e T
A W N = O VWV o0 N O N BN~ WD = ©

oS 341 IS

17

“(I) in exchange for such owner-
ship interest, and
“(IT) specifically for use in con-
nection with qualified research activi-
ties.
For purposes of the preceding sentence,
the taxpayer’s basis shall not include any
portion of such basis which is attributable
to an increase in a partner’s share of the
liabilities of a partnership that is consid-
ered under section 752(a) as a contribution
of money.

“(C) TREATMENT OF CARRYOVERS.—Sub-

paragraph (B)(i) shall not apply to the portion
of any loss or deduction that is carried over
under subsection (b) into a taxable year other
than the taxable year in which such loss or de-
duction arose.

“(D) QUALIFIED RESEARCH ACTIVITY.—
For purposes of this paragraph, the term
‘qualified research activity’ means any activity
constituting qualified research (within the
meaning of section 41(d)(1)(B) and taking into

account paragraphs (3) and (4) of section



O o0 N N B W =

|\ IR N© TR NG T NS R NS R N e T e T e T e e e T
A W N = O VWV 0O N O B BN WD == ©

oS 341 IS

18

41(d)) which involves a process of experimen-
tation.

“(E) HIGH TECHNOLOGY RESEARCH
SMALL BUSINESS PASS-THRU ENTITY.—Kor
purposes of this paragraph, the term ‘high tech-
nology research small business pass-thru entity’
means any domestic pass-thru entity for any
taxable year if—

“(1) either—

“(I) more than 75 percent of the
entity’s expenditures (including sala-
ries, rent and overhead) for such tax-
able year are paid or incurred in con-
nection with qualified research (within
the meaning of section 41(d)(1)(B),
taking into account paragraphs (3)
and (4) of section 41(d)) that involves
a process of experimentation con-
ducted by the entity, or

“(II) more than 50 percent of
the entity’s expenditures for such tax-
able year constitute qualified research
expenses (as defined in section 41(b),

but determined without regard to the



O o0 N N W BB W

| \O JEE \© R O R \O B O B N e T e e e e T e e e e
A W O = O O 0NN N N R WD = O

oS 341 IS

19

phrase ‘65 percent of’ in paragraph

(3)(A) thereof),

“(i1) such entity is a small business
(within ~ the  meaning  of  section
41(b)(3)(D)(111), applied by substituting
‘2507 for ‘500’ in subclause (I) thereof),
and

“(i11) at no time during the taxable
yvear does the entity have aggregate gross
assets in excess of $150,000,000.

“(F) PROVISIONS RELATED TO AGGRE-

GATE GROSS ASSETS LIMITATION.—For pur-

poses of this paragraph—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—Except as other-
wise provided in this subparagraph, the
term ‘agoregate gross assets’ has the
meaning given such term in section
1202(d)(2).

“(i1) EXCEPTION FOR CERTAIN IN-

TANGIBLES.

Any section 197 intangible
(as defined in section 197(d) and deter-
mined without regard to section 197(e))
which is used directly in connection with

the research referred to in subparagraph



O o0 N N B W =

[\© TN NG T N T NG I NG I NS B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ B NG U N N e = N R - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

oS 341 IS

20

(E)(1) shall not be taken into account in
determining aggregate gross assets.

“(i11) EXCEPTION FOR CERTAIN FOL-
LOW-ON INVESTMENTS.—Cash from a sale
of equity interests shall not be taken into
account in determining aggregate gross as-
sets 1f—

“(I) the aggregate gross assets of
such entity (determined immediately
after such sale and without regard to
this clause) do not exceed the sum of
$150,000,000, plus 25 percent of the
ageregate gross assets of such entity
(determined immediately before such
sale and without regard to this
clause), and

“(II) the aggregate gross assets
of such entity (determined imme-
diately before such sale and without
regard to this clause) do not exceed
$150,000,000.

Sales of equity interests which are part of
the same plan or arrangement, or which
are carried out with the principal purpose

of Increasing the amount of cash to which



O© o0 3 O WD A W N =

| \O 2N \© R O R O N N0 R T e e e T e T e e e e
A W D= O O 0NN N N R WD = O

21

this clause applies (determined without re-
card to this sentence), shall be treated as
a single sale for purposes of this clause.
“(iv) INFLATION ADJUSTMENT.—In
the case of any taxable year beginning
after 2016, the $150,000,000 amount in
subparagraph (E)(ii1) and subeclauses (I)
and (II) of clause (ii1) shall each be in-
creased by an amount equal to—
“(I) such dollar amount, multi-
plied by
“(IT) the cost of living adjust-
ment determined under section 1(f)(3)
for the calendar year in which the tax-
able year begins determined by sub-
stituting ‘calendar year 2015’ for ‘cal-
endar year 1992’ in subparagraph (B)
thereof.
Any increase determined under the pre-
ceding sentence shall be rounded to the
nearest $100,000.
“(G) CAPITAL EXPENDITURES TAKEN INTO
ACCOUNT FOR EXPENDITURES TEST.—An ex-

penditure shall not fail to be taken into account

oS 341 IS



O o0 N N B W

[\© TN NG T N T NG N NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B NG U N N = = N R - BN B e ) W ) LR ~S O I NO S e

oS 341 IS

22

under subparagraph (E)(i1) merely because such
expenditure is chargeable to capital account.

“(H) PASS-THRU ENTITY.—For purposes
of this paragraph, the term ‘pass-thru entity’
means any partnership, S corporation, or other
entity identified by the Secretary as a pass-thru
entity for purposes of this paragraph.

“(I) AGGREGATION RULES.

“(1) IN GENERAL.—AIl persons treat-
ed as a single employer under subsection

(a) or (b) of section 52, or subsection (m)

or (o) of section 414, shall be treated as a

single entity for purposes of subparagraphs

(E) and (F)(in).

“(11) LIMITATION WHERE ENTITY

WOULD NOT QUALIFY.—No entity shall be

treated as a high technology research small

business pass-thru entity unless such enti-
ty qualifies as such both with and without

the application of clause (i).

“(J) ACTIVITIES NOT ENGAGED IN FOR
PROFIT AND ECONOMIC SUBSTANCE RULES.—
Section 183 and the economic substance rules
of section 7701(o) shall not apply to disallow

the losses, deductions, and credits of a high



O o0 N N B W

[\O I \© R \O I O R N e e e e e e T e e
W N = O O 0N N RN = O

24
25

23

technology research small business pass-thru
entity solely as a result of losses incurred by
such entity.”.

(b) MATERIAL PARTICIPATION NOT REQUIRED.—
Paragraph (5) of section 469(¢) of such Code, as redesig-
nated by subsection (a), is amended by striking “and (3)”
in the heading and text and inserting *, (3), and (4)”.

(¢) CERTAIN RESEARCH-RELATED DEDUCTIONS AND
CREDITS OF Hicn TECHNOLOGY RESEARCH SMALL
BUSINESS PASS-THRU ENTITIES ALLOWED FOR PUR-
POSES OF DETERMINING ALTERNATIVE MINIMUM TAX.—

(1) DEDUCTION FOR RESEARCH AND EXPERI-

MENTAL EXPENDITURES.—Paragraph (2) of section

26(b) of such Code is amended by adding at the end

the following new subparagraph:

“(E) EXCEPTION FOR HIGH TECHNOLOGY
RESEARCH SMALL BUSINESS PASS-THRU ENTI-
TIES.—In the case of a high technology re-
search small business pass-thru entity (as de-
fined in section 469(c)(4)), this paragraph shall
not apply to any amount allowable as a deduc-
tion under section 174(a).”.

(2) ALLOWANCE OF CERTAIN RESEARCI-RE-

LATED CREDITS.—Subparagraph (B) of section

38(e)(4) of such Code is amended by redesignating

oS 341 IS



O o0 N N B W

e T e S e e S e S e
o N O W kA W NN = O

24

clauses (i1) through (ix) as clauses (ii1) through (x),

respectively, and by inserting after clause (i) the fol-

lowing new clause:

“(11) the ecredits of an individual tax-
payer determined under section 41 to the
extent attributable to a high technology re-
search small business pass-thru entity (as
defined in section 469(¢)(4)),”.

(d) EXCEPTION TO LIMITATION ON PASs-THRU OF
RESEARCH CREDIT.—Subsection (g) of section 41 of such
Code is amended by adding at the end the following:
“Paragraphs (2) and (4) shall not apply with respect to
any high technology research small business pass-thru en-
tity (as defined in section 469(c)(4)).”.

(e) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
this section shall apply to losses and credits arising in tax-

able years beginning on or after the date of the enactment

of this Act.

oS 341 IS




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2015-02-10T22:41:42-0500
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




