AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

11

Calendar No. 708

118TH CONGRESS
LS, 4700

[Report No. 118-302]

To modify the governmentwide financial management plan, and for other
purposes.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

Jury 11 (legislative day, JuLy 10), 2024
Mr. LANKFORD (for himself and Ms. HASSAN) introduced the following bill;
which was read twice and referred to the Committee on Homeland Secu-
rity and Governmental Affairs
DECEMBER 17 (legislative day, DECEMBER 16), 2024
Reported by Mr. PETERS, with an amendment

[Strike out all after the enacting clause and insert the part printed in italic]

A BILL

To modify the governmentwide financial management plan,
and for other purposes.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-

2 tiwes of the United States of America in Congress assembled,

3 SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

4 This Aet may be etted as the “hmprovine Federal £t



2
1 SEC. 2. CHIEF FINANCIAL OFFICERS; GOVERNMENTWIDE

2 FINANCIAL, MANAGEMENT PLAN.

5 Rtutes Codes 15 attended—

6 1 b seetion 90200—

8 b strikiee =An™ and insertire he shall be the

10 nanetal Offteer to oversee and provide leader-
11 ship 1 the areas of budeet formulation and
12 exeettot; phntne and performanee; risk man-
14 aeeotntne; and other areas as the Director of
15 the Offiee of Mutmeement ahd Brdeet tae des-
17 eachs

18 B} 1 paragraph 35—

19 t i subparagraph (0} by thserting
20 Savens ahd? before “systemsl and

21 ) 1 sabparagraph (H)—

23 i ot Hhe ends
24 (B i eanse @v; by striking

25 “performance:’ and ihsertine  “per-

*S 4700 RS



1 formatee and tteeration of perform-
3 HH by addine at the end the
4 folowte:

8 eiples;y—

9 t0) by redesignating pearageaph (8 as
10 paragraph (10

12 through (1 as paragraphs (6) through (5 re-
13 speetivels

14 5 by inserting after paragraph (4 the
15 foHowtne:

16 5 prepare; th eonstdtation with finanerd manaee-
17 ment and other appropriate experts; an ageney plan to -
18 plement the d-vear finanetadl munacement phn prepared

22 whieh shatt—

23 “HA) be completed within 90 days of the
24 tsstanee of o eovernmentwide plan wnder seetion
25 FoE2 a2 of this Hitle;

*S 4700 RS



O o0 9 N U B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

4
Ciof i} Officer:

*S 4700 RS



O o0 N N B W =

[\© TN NG T NG T NS I NS R NS R N e T e e T e T e T T
LN A W D= OO NN NN R, WD = O

B)
G i sebparagraph G by striking
() the progress of the ageney i mple-
5%
(i) the progress of the ageney i Hnple-
) 1 elanse 4 as se des-
made by the Federal Managers™ Fi-

*S 4700 RS



6
atel
=it the reporting of the ageney under the

O o0 N N W B W =

[ w—
- O

12 HH H prreaeraph 69 s 80 redestetirted—
13 B by strikine “montter the” and n-

[—
N

performanee reports; and” and msertine a

sepreolon:

5 by mserting after paragraph (8% a8 se
21 9 be responsible for hinkine performance and eost
24  ineorporate eost nformation

DO = = e e
S O o0 a4 O W

*S 4700 RS



O o0 N N W B W =

|\ I N© TR NG T NS R NS R e e T e T e e T
A LW PO = O VOV 0 N O wn kA WD = O

7
fRated—

*S 4700 RS



O o0 9 AN U B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

8
amended—
etal management plan and a finaneial manage-

*S 4700 RS



O o0 N N B W =

[\© TN NG T N T NS I NS R NS R N e T e e T e T e T T
b A W D= OO0 NN NN R, WD = O

9

Government i & manner that 18 stra-
B by adding at the end the fol-

ahet

*S 4700 RS



O o0 N N B W =

[\© TN NG I N T NG I NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
b A W D= OO NN NN R, WD = O

*S 4700 RS



O o0 N N B W =

[\ I NS R T e e T e T e T e D e e T
—_— O O o0 N N O nm R~ WD = O

22
23
24
25

11
A i ehause (it by striking
“dentify” and mserting “provide &
“and” at the end:
D 1 elanse 95 as so redeste-
“A) a deseription and analysis of the statas of

*S 4700 RS



O o0 N N W B W =

|\ IR N© TR NG T NS R NS R e e T e T e T T W
A LW PO = O VOV 0 N O R WD = O

12
e
=B o sttt of the perfortatee of aoehetes
e
HE) a summary of the most recently eompleted
“H5 a summary of reports on internal aceount-

*S 4700 RS



O o0 N N D B W =

[\ TN NG T N T NG I NG N NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
LN A W D= OO0 NN NN R, WD = O

13
=Y a hstite of aeeneres whose frarent s
31 U5 3512 nete); and a summary statement of
and
stders appropriate to fally mform Congress regard-

prres the Frratetad mrotitocment of the Federd G
E 51'77,

&5 1 paraeraph (H—
the date of the enactment of this sub-
abter the date of ermetment of the Tm-

*S 4700 RS



O o0 N N Bk W =

| \O 2N \© R O R \O B O B e e e e e T e e e e
A LW PO = O VOV 0 N O wn kA WD = O

*S 4700 RS

14
thereafter” and imsertinge “At =a

bhy by striking “fnancial
management statas report and &

whh Hiserte  Seoverttrentiveide
4-year™; and

ated
ated



O o0 N N BB W =

| \O JEE \© R O R \O B O B e e e e e T e e e e
A W D= O O 0NN N N R WD = O

15
(bb} by striking “paragraph
DB ) and inserting “papa-
Comptroter Geteral a finanetnd manaeement statas
“and at the ends
teH

*S 4700 RS



O o0 N N W B W =

| \O 2R \© R \O R \O B O R N e e e e e T e e e e
A LW PO = O VWV 0 N O R WD = O

16

*S 4700 RS



17

4 auditer shal—

9 this tite;

10 “B) determine swhether these eontrels have
11 been implemented;

14 trols to conclade whether the eontrols are operatine
15 effeetively; neludine suffieient tests to support & low
16 fevel of wssessed control #iske and

17 D) eommunieate econtrols that the auditer
18 econelades are not suttably destened and implemented
19 or are not operatine effectivelys as appropriate under
20 appheable generally aeceepted government andttne
21 standards:

22 3 Andits under this subseetion shall be eon-
23 dueted—> and

*S 4700 RS



O o0 N N W Bk W =

e T S N N e e e T e T
O o0 N O »n B~ W NN = O

20
21
22
23
24
25

18

Y CEYIRVEIVE VAR o et

Seetion 3348{e) of title 5; United States Code; is amend-
ed—
tH i paragraph (3); by adding “er” at the
ench

35) by redestenating paragraph (5) &8 para-

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Improving Federal Fi-
nancial Management Act”.
SEC. 2. CHIEF FINANCIAL OFFICERS; GOVERNMENTWIDE FI-

NANCIAL MANAGEMENT PLAN.

(a) CHIEF FINANCIAL OFFICER AND DEpPUTY CHIEF
FINaNcIAL OFFICER.—Chapter 9 of title 31, United States
Jode, 1s amended—

(1) in section 902(a)—

(A) in the matter preceding paragraph (1),
by striking “An” and inserting “It shall be the
duty and responsibility of each agency Chief Fi-
nancial Officer to oversee and provide leadership

m the areas of budget formulation and execution,

*S 4700 RS



O© o0 3 O WD B W N

[\ I \© R \O I O R N e e e e e e T e e
W = O O 0N N N RN = O

19
planning and performance, risk management,
wternal controls, financial systems, accounting,
and other areas as the Director of the Office of
Management and Budget may designate. In car-
rying out the preceding sentence, each’;
(B) in paragraph (3)—

(1) wn subparagraph (C), by inserting
“areas and” before “systems”’; and

(11) wn subparagraph (D)—

(I) in clause (111), by striking
“and” at the end;

(Il) in clause (w), by striking
“performance;” and inserting “per-
Jormance and integration of perform-
ance and cost information; and”; and

(I11) by adding at the end the fol-
lowing:

“(v) annual agency financial state-
ments prepared in accordance with United
States generally accepted accounting prin-
ciples;”;

(C) by redesignating paragraph (8) as
paragraph (10);

*S 4700 RS



O© o0 3 O WD B W N

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

20
(D) by redestgnating  paragraphs —(5)
through (7) as paragraphs (6) through (8), re-
spectively;
(E) by inserting after paragraph (4) the fol-
lowing:

“(5) prepare, in consultation with financial manage-

ment and other appropriate experts, an agency plan to im-
plement the 4-year financial management plan prepared by
the Director of the Office of Management and Budget under
section 3512(a)(2) of this title and to achieve and sustain

effective financial management in the agency, which shall—

“(A) be completed within 90 days of the issuance
of a governmentwide plan under section 3512(a)(2) of
thas title;

“(B) be revised as determined necessary by the
Chief Financial Officer;

“(C) include performance-based financial man-
agement metrics against which the financial manage-
ment performance of the agency shall be assessed; and

“(D) be submitted upon completion or revision to
the head of the agency, the Dirvector of the Office of
Management and Budget, the Comptroller General,
and appropriate committees of Congress, and be made
publicly available;”;

(F) in paragraph (6), as so redesignated—

*S 4700 RS



O© o0 3 O WD B W N

|\ I NO TR NG T NS R NS R L e e T e D e e T S
A W N = O VWV o0 NN O B BN~ WD = O

21

(1) by striking subparagraph (A);

(1t) by redesignating subparagraphs
(B) through (E) as subparagraphs (A)
through (D), respectively; and

(111) in subparagraph (C), as so redes-
wnated, by adding “and” at the end;
(G) i paragraph (7), as so redesignated—

(1) i the matter preceding subpara-
graph (A), by striking “and the Director of
the Office of Management and Budget,” and
wmserting “, the Director of the Office of
Management and Budget, the Comptroller
General, and appropriate committees of
Congress, which shall be made publicly
available and’;

(i11) in subparagraph (A), by striking
“agency;” and inserting “agency, includ-
Mg—

“(1) the progress of the agency in imple-

menting the agency plan described in paragraph

(5);

“(11) the progress of the agency in 1mple-

menting the governmentwide 4-year financial

management plan prepared by the Director of

*S 4700 RS



O© o0 3 O WD B W N

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

22
the Office of Management and Budget under sec-
tron 3512(a)(2) of this title; and

“(i11) the performance of the agency against
Jinancial management metrics established by the
Director of the Office of Management and Budg-
et;”; and

(111) in subparagraph (D)—

(1) by striking “of the reports”
and inserting “of—

“(1) the reports™;

(II) wn clause (1), as so des-
wgnated, by striking “the amendments
made by the Federal Managers’ Finan-
cial Integrity Act of 1982 (Public law
97-255); and” and inserting “section
3512(d) of this title;”; and

(I11) by adding at the end the fol-
lowing:

“(11) agency spending data published under
the Federal Funding Accountability and Trans-
parency Act of 2006 (31 U.S.C. 6101 note); and

“(11) the reporting of the agency under the
Federal  Financial  Management  Improvement
Act of 1996 (31 U.S.C. 3512 note); and’’;

(H) in paragraph (8), as so redesignated—

*S 4700 RS



O© o0 3 O WD B W N

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

23

(1) by striking “monitor the” and in-
sert “manage the formulation and”; and

(11) by striking *, and prepare and
submat to the head of the agency timely per-
Sformance reports; and” and inserting «a
semicolon;
(1) by wnserting after paragraph (8), as so

redesignated, the following:

“(9) be responsible for linking performance and cost
mformation, mcluding the preparation and submaission to
the head of the agency of timely performance reports that
wmcorporate cost information;”;

(J) mn paragraph (10), as so redesignated—
(1) by inserting “inflation and” before
“costs”; and
(i11) by striking the period at the end
and inserting “; and’’; and
(K) by adding at the end the following:
“(11) coordinate with senior agency personnel,
mcluding the Chief Data Officer, Chief Information

Officer, Chief Performance Olfficer, Chief Acquisition

Officer, Chief Risk Officer, and Chief Evaluation Offi-

cer of the agency on—

“(A) the exercise of authorities under this

subsection; and

*S 4700 RS



O© o0 3 O WD B W N

[\ TN NG T N T NG I NG I NS B S e e T e e T e T e e T
[ T N O N N = =N e R - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O I NO I e

24

“(B) the strategic planning, performance
measurement and reporting, and risk manage-
ment functions of the agency.”; and
(2) in section 903—

(A) n subsection (a), by inserting “and
who shall assist the agency Chief Financial Offi-
cer i the performance of each of the duties of the
agency Chief Financial Officer under this chap-
ter” after “matters”; and

(B) by adding at the end the following:

“(c) Notwithstanding subchapter II1 of chapter 33 of
title 5, in the event of a vacancy in the position of Chief
Financial Officer of an agency, the Deputy Chief Financial
Officer of the agency shall serve as the acting Chief Finan-
cial Officer.”.

(b)  GOVERNMENTWIDE —FINANCIAL ~ MANAGEMENT
Pran.—Section 3512 of title 31, United States Code, 1is
amended—

(1) in subsection (a)—

(A) wn paragraph (1), by striking “a finan-
cial management status report and a govern-
mentwide 5-year financial management plan”
and inserting “a governmentwide 4-year finan-
cial management plan and a financial manage-

ment status report’;

*S 4700 RS



O© o0 3 O WD B W N

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

25

(B) by striking paragraph (2);

(C) by redesignating paragraph (3) as
paragraph (2);

(D) n paragraph (2), as so redesignated—

(1) in subparagraph (A)—

(I) by striking “5-year” and in-
serting “4-year”;

(I1) by striking “shall describe”
and inserting the following: “shall—

“(1) describe”;

(III) wn clause (1), as so des-
wgnated, by striking “5 fiscal years to
mmprove the financial management of
the Federal Government.” and insert-
mg “4 fiscal years to improve the fi-
nancial management of the Federal
Government in a manner that is stra-
tegic, comprehensive, and cost-effective;
and”; and

(IV) by adding at the end the fol-
lowing:

“(11) be developed in consultation with the
Chief Financial Officers Council, the Chief Infor-
mation Officers Council, the Chief Data Officer
Council, the Chief Acquisition Officers Council,

*S 4700 RS



O© o0 3 O WD B W N

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

26

the Council of the Inspectors General on Integ-
rity and Efficiency, the Government Account-
ability Office, and, as appropriate, other coun-
cils and financial management experts.”; and

(11) wn subparagraph (B)—

(I) in the matter preceding clause

(1), by striking “5-year” and inserting

“4-year’;

(II) in clause (111)—

(aa) by striking ‘‘for devel-
oping” and inserting “for improv-
g financial management  sys-
tems, including—

“(1) developing”; and

(bb) by adding at the end the
Jollowing:

“(I1) linking performance and cost in-
Jormation to facilitate effective and efficient
decision making;

“(I11) eliminating duplicative and un-
necessary systems and activities; and

“(IV) adentifying  opportunities  for
agencies to share systems and services and
encouraging agencies to do so where prac-

ticable;”;

*S 4700 RS



O© o0 3 O WD B W N

|\ I NO TR NG T NS R NS R L e e T e D e e T S
A W N = O VWV o0 NN O B BN~ WD = O

27
(I11) by striking clause (1v);
(IV) by redesignating clause (v)
as clause (1v);
(V) by inserting after clause (iv),
as so redesignated, the following:
“(v) provide a strategy for reporting per-
Jormance and cost information;”;
(VI) in clause (vi), by striking “5-
year” and inserting “4-year’’;
(VII) in clause (vii), by striking
“identify” and inserting “provide a
strateqy for strengthening the Federal
financial management workforce, in-
cluding identification of”;
(VIII) in clause (vii), by striking
“and” at the end;
(IX) by redesignating clause (ix)
as clause (x);
(X) by inserting after clause (viii)
the following:
“(ix) include comprehensive financial man-
agement  performance-based — metrics  against
whach the financial management performance of

executive agencies can be assessed; and’; and

*S 4700 RS



O© o0 3 O WD B W N

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

28

(XI) in clause (x), as so redesig-
nated, by striking “5-year” and insert-
g “4-year’’;
(E) by inserting after paragraph (2) the fol-
lowing:

“(3) A financial management status report under this

subsection shall include—

“(A) a description and analysis of the status of
Jinancial management n the executive branch, in-
cluding the progress made towards implementing the
governmentwide 4-year financial management plan,
the status of remaining challenges, and, as necessary
based on obligations or expenditures, any updates or
revisions to the cost estimates included wn the most re-
cent governmentwide 4-year financial management
plan;

“(B) a summary of the performance of agencies
against the metrics developed and identified by the
Divector of the Office of Management and Budget in
the governmentwide 4-year financial management
plan;

“(C) a summary of the most recently completed
Jinancial statements—

“(1) of Federal agencies under section 3515

of this title; and

*S 4700 RS



O o0 9 N U B W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

29

“(11) of Government corporations;

“(D) a summary of the most recently completed
Jinancial statement audits and reports—

“(v) of Federal agencies under subsections

(e) and (f) of section 3521 of this title; and

“(11) of Government corporations;

“(E) a summary of reports on internal account-
mg and administrative control systems submitted to
the President and Congress under subsection (d);

“(F) a lsting of agencies whose financial man-
agement systems do not comply substantially with the
requirements of section 803(a) of the Federal Finan-
cial  Management Improvement Act of 1996 (31
URS.C. 3512 note), and a summary statement of the
efforts underway to remedy the noncompliance; and

“(G) any other information the Director con-
siders appropriate to fully inform Congress regarding
the financial management of the Federal Govern-
ment.”’;

(F) wn paragraph (4)—
(1) i subparagraph (A)—
(I) by striking “15 months after
the date of the enactment of this sub-
section” and inserting “6 months after

the date of enactment of the Improving

*S 4700 RS



O© o0 3 O WD B W N

|\ I NO TR NG T NS R NS R L e e T e D e e T S
A W N = O VWV o0 NN O B BN~ WD = O

*S 4700 RS

30
Federal Financial Management Act”;
and
(I1) by striking “5-year” and in-
serting “4-year”; and
(11) wn subparagraph (B)—
(1) in clause (1)—

(aa) by striking “Not later
than January 31 of each year
thereafter” and inserting “At «a
minimum, concurrvently with the
submisston of the budget of the
United States Government under
section 1105(a) of this title made
wm the first full fiscal year fol-
lowing any year in which the
term of the President commences
under section 101 of title 37;

(bb) by striking ‘financial
management status report and a
revised — governmentwide 5-year”
and inserting “governmentwide 4-
year”; and

(cc) by striking “5  fiscal

years” and all  that  follows



O© o0 3 O WD B W N

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

31
through the period at the end and
wmserting “4 fiscal years.”; and
(II) in clause (11)—

(aa) by striking “revised gov-
ernmentwide 5-year” and insert-
g “governmentwide  4-year’;
and

(bb) by striking “paragraph
(3)(B)(viir)” and inserting “para-
graph (2)(B)(vii1)”’; and

(1) by adding at the end the fol-

“(C) Each year, concurrently with the submais-

sion of the budget of the United States Government

under section 1105(a) of this title, the Director of the

Office of Management and Budget shall submit to the

appropriate committees of Congress and the Comp-

troller General a financial management status re-

port.”; and

(G) by striking paragraph (5);

(2) an subsection (d)(2)—

at the end;

(4) wn subparagraph (A), by striking “and”

(B) wn subparagraph (B), by striking the

period at the end and inserting *; and”; and

*S 4700 RS



O o0 9 N U B W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

32
(C) by adding at the end the following:

“(C) a separate report on the results of the as-
sessment and conclusion required wunder subsection
(€)(2).7;

(3) by redesignating subsections (e), (f), and (g)
as subsections (f), (g), and (h), respectively; and

(4) by nserting after subsection (d) the fol-
lowing:

“(e) The head of each executive agency shall—

“(1) in establishing the internal accounting and
administrative controls under subsection (c), identify
the key financial management information needed for
effective financial management and decision making;
and

“(2) annually assess and make a conclusion on
the effectiveness of the internal controls of the execu-
tiwe agency over financial reporting and key financial
management information identified under paragraph
(1).”.

(c) AUDITS BY AGENCIES.—Section 3521 of title 31,

United States Code, 1is amended—

(1) in subsection (e)—
(A) by redesignating paragraphs (1) and
(2) as subparagraphs (A) and (B), respectively,

and adjusting the margins accordingly;

*S 4700 RS



33

(B) by striking “(e) Each financial” and
mserting “(e)(1) Each financial’;

(C) wn paragraph (1), as so designated, by
striking  “standards—" and inserting ‘‘stand-
ards.”’; and

(D) by inserting after paragraph (1), as so
designated, the following:

“2) As part of each audit under this subsection, the

auditor shall—

“(A) evaluate the design of the internal control
of the agency over financial reporting and key finan-
cial information, as assessed and reported on by the
head of the agency under section 3512(d)(2)(C) of this
title;

“(B) determine whether those controls have been
implemented;

“(C) for controls that are properly designed and
mmplemented, perform sufficient tests of those controls
to conclude whether the controls are operating effec-
twely, including sufficient tests to support a low level
of assessed control risk; and

“(D) communicate controls that the auditor con-
cludes are not switably designed and implemented or

are not operating effectively, as appropriate under

*S 4700 RS



34

1 applicable generally accepted government auditing
2 standards.

3 “(3) Audits under this subsection shall be conducted—
4 7. and

5 (2) an  subsection (h), by striking “section
6 3512(a)(3)(B)(viir)” and mserting “section
7 3512(a)(2)(B)(vii)”.

8 (d) TECHNICAL AND CONFORMING AMENDMENT.—Sec-
9 tion 3348(e) of title 5, United States Code, is amended—
10 (1) in paragraph (3), by adding “or” at the end;
11 (2) by striking paragraph (4); and

12 (3) by redesignating paragraph (5) as para-
13 graph (4).

*S 4700 RS






Calendar No. 708

118t CONGRESS
2D SESSION mo hqcc

[Report No. 118-302]

A BILL

To modify the governmentwide financial
management plan, and for other purposes.

DECEMBER 17 (legislative day, DECEMBER 16), 2024

Reported with an amendment




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2024-12-19T21:07:16-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




