AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

118TH CONGRESS
L S, 5005

AN ACT

To authorize additional funding for the San Joaquin River
Restoration Settlement Act.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-

2 tiwes of the United States of America in Congress assembled,



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

e N T e T
whn A WD = O

2
SECTION 1. ADDITIONAL FUNDING FOR THE SAN JOAQUIN

RIVER RESTORATION SETTLEMENT ACT.

(a) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS TO IMPLE-
MENT SETTLEMENT.—Section 10009 of the San Joaquin
River Restoration Settlement Act (Public Law 111-11;
123 Stat. 1355) 1s amended—

(1) in  subsection (a)(1), by striking

“$250,000,000” and inserting “$750,000,000”; and

(2) in  subsection (b)(1), by striking

“$250,000,000” and inserting “$750,000,000”.

(b)  AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS TFOR
FRIANT DIVISION IMPROVEMENTS.—Section 10203(¢) of
the Omnibus Public Land Management Act of 2009 (Pub-
lic Law 111-11; 123 Stat. 1367) is amended by striking
“$50,000,000” and inserting “$75,000,000”.

Passed the Senate December 17 (legislative day, De-
cember 16), 2024.

Attest:

Secretary.

S 5005 ES






118TH CONGRESS
2D SESSION m. m°°m

AN ACT

To authorize additional funding for the San
Joaquin River Restoration Settlement Act.




 
   
     118th CONGRESS
     2d Session
     S. 5005
     IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES
     AN ACT
     To authorize additional funding for the San Joaquin River Restoration Settlement Act.
  
   
     
       1.
       Additional funding for the San Joaquin River Restoration Settlement Act
       
         (a)
         Authorization of appropriations To implement Settlement
         Section 10009 of the San Joaquin River Restoration Settlement Act (Public Law 111–11; 123 Stat. 1355) is amended—
         
           (1)
           in subsection (a)(1), by striking  $250,000,000 and inserting  $750,000,000; and
        
         
           (2)
           in subsection (b)(1), by striking  $250,000,000 and inserting  $750,000,000.
        
      
       
         (b)
         Authorization of appropriations for Friant Division improvements
         Section 10203(c) of the Omnibus Public Land Management Act of 2009 (Public Law 111–11; 123 Stat. 1367) is amended by striking  $50,000,000 and inserting ‘‘$75,000,000”. 
      
    
  
   
     
       Passed the Senate December 17 (legislative day, December 16), 2024.
       
      
       Secretary
    
  
   
  


		Superintendent of Documents
	2024-12-18T02:50:13-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




